
than 10% of the burden imposed by the
certifications. Many small employers
that maintain group health plans have
their plans administered by an insurance
company or third party administrators
(TPAs). Most insurers and TPAs are
expected to automate the certification
process and therefore their average time
to produce a certificate should be simi-
lar to the 5 to 12 minute average
estimated for all employers. However,
even for small employers that do not
automate the certification process, the
collection of information requirements
in the regulation will not have a signifi-
cant impact. Even if it is conservatively
assumed that their average time to pro-
duce a certificate is 3 times as long as
the highest estimate for all employers
(i.e., 36 minutes per certificate) and that
all of their employees are covered by
their group health plan and that half of
the employees receive a certificate each
year, and this figure is then increased by
10% to account for the paperwork bur-
dens apart from the certifications, the
average burden per employee is only 20
minutes per year. Thus, for example, for
an employer with 10 employees, the
annual burden would be 3 hours and 20
minutes per year. At an estimated cost
of $11 per hour, this would result in a
cost of less than $37 per year for the
employer, which is not a significant
economic impact.
This regulation is not subject to the

Unfunded Mandates Reform Act of
1995 because the regulation is an inter-
pretive regulation. For further informa-
tion and for analyses relating to the joint
rulemaking, see the preamble to the
joint rulemaking. Pursuant to section
7805(f) of the Internal Revenue Code,
this notice of proposed rulemaking will
be submitted to the Chief Counsel for
Advocacy of the Small Business Admin-
istration for comment on its impact on
small business.

Comments and Requests for a Public
Hearing

Before these proposed regulations are
adopted as final regulations, consider-
ation will be given to any written com-
ments (a signed original and eight (8)

copies) that are submitted timely to the
IRS. All comments will be available for
public inspection and copying. A public
hearing may be scheduled if requested
in writing by a person that timely
submits written comments. If a public
hearing is scheduled, notice of the date,
time, and place for the hearing will be
published in theFederal Register.

Drafting Information

The principal author of these pro-
posed regulations is Russ Weinheimer,
Office of the Chief Counsel, Employee
Benefits and Exempt Organizations.
However, other personnel from the IRS
and Treasury Department participated in
their development. The proposed regula-
tions, as well as the temporary regula-
tions, have been developed in coordina-
tion with personnel from the U.S.
Department of Labor and U.S. Depart-
ment of Health and Human Services.

* * * * *

Proposed Amendments to the Regula-
tions

Accordingly, 26 CFR part 54 is pro-
posed to be amended as follows:

PART 54—PENSION EXCISE TAXES

Paragraph 1. The authority citation
for part 54 is amended by adding entries
in numerical order to read as follows:
Authority: 26 U.S.C. 7805 * * *
Section 54.9801–1 is also issued un-

der 26 U.S.C. 9806.
Section 54.9801–2 is also issued un-

der 26 U.S.C. 9806.
Section 54.9801–3 is also issued un-

der 26 U.S.C. 9806.
Section 54.9801–4 is also issued un-

der 26 U.S.C. 9806.
Section 54.9801–5 is also issued un-

der 26 U.S.C. 9801(c)(4), 9801(e)(3),
and 9806.
Section 54.9801–6 is also issued un-

der 26 U.S.C. 9806.
Section 54.9802–1 is also issued un-

der 26 U.S.C. 9806.
Section 54.9804–1 is also issued un-

der 26 U.S.C. 9806.
Section 54.9806–1 is also issued un-

der 26 U.S.C. 9806. * * *

Par. 2. Sections 54.9801–1,
54.9801–2, 54.9801–3, 54.9801– 4,
54.9801–5, 54.9801–6, 54.9802–1,
54.9804–1, and 54.9806–1 are added to
read as follows:
[The text of these proposed sections

is the same as the text of §§ 54.9801–
1T, 54.9801–2T, 54.9801–3T, 54.9801–
4T, 54.9801–5T, 54.9801–6T, 54.9802–
1T, 54.9804–1T, and 54.9806–1T
published in T.D. 8716.]

Margaret Milner Richardson,
Commissioner of Internal Revenue.

(Filed by the Office of the Federal Register on
April 1, 1997, 12:48 p.m., and published in the
issue of the Federal Register for April 8, 1997, 62
F.R. 16977)

Availability of Publication 968, Tax
Benefits for Adoption

Announcement 97–47

New Publication 968 will be available
in May, 1997. The publication explains
the new tax credit for expenses con-
nected with the adoption of a child. The
credit can be as much as $5,000 ($6,000
for a child with special needs). The
publication also covers the exclusion
from income for employer-provided
adoption benefits. The exclusion can be
as much as $5,000 ($6,000 for a child
with special needs). Taxpayers may be
able to claim both the credit and the
exclusion if the total amount of adoption
expenses are more than the amount
provided by the employer.
Adoption tax benefits are effective for

tax years beginning in 1997. New Form
8839 is being developed for taxpayers to
figure the credit and exclusion. The
form will be available in January, 1998
for taxpayers to file with their 1997 tax
return.
You can get a copy of this publication

by calling 1–800–829–3676. Or you can
write to the IRS Forms Distribution
Center nearest you. Check your income
tax package for the address. Local adop-
tion agencies also may have a copy. The
publication is also available on the IRS
Internet Web Site at www.irs.ustreas.
gov.
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